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5 November 2025 
 
Dear  
 
RE: SCCL-FOI-2025/26-106 
 
Thank you for your FOI request received by the FOI office for the following information. Your request 
has been handled as a request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 and SCCL 
are able to provide a response in blue below: 
 

1. Where such QA or audit information would ordinarily be held within SCCL, its contractors, or 
other NHS entities (for example, DHSC, NHS England, or the outsourced logistics/QA testing 
providers). 
The QA conducted on the products SCCL transact is done by the Regulatory Compliance team 
at the time of tender and any mid-framework changes e.g. range extension, so the information 
is held by SCCL. QC checks conducted on receipt to an NHS Supply Chain warehouse is a 
visual check to ensure that products are undamaged e.g. that they are dry and where 
applicable shipping cases are intact.  
Audit information is held in our eQMS Navex IRM which our logistics provider also uses so we 
have clear oversight specifically around goods distribution practice (GDP) requirements and 
any deviations that occur. Please note that this only relates to products stored within an NHS 
Supply Chain warehouse. 
SCCL does not hold the information regarding how DHSC and NHS England hold their QA or 
audit information, you may wish to redirect your request to their FOI departments. 
 

2. Which information asset owner or department is responsible for maintaining QA and audit data 
relating to goods received into NHS Supply Chain warehouses. 
As above the Regulatory Compliance team conduct the QA and the due diligence checks on 
conformity documentation where applicable, UKAS accredited or international equivalent (IAF) 
QMS ISO certification, that the products are registered with the MHRA where applicable and 
that the GMDN codes are current. For medicinal products SCCL have two responsible persons 
named on our WDA(H) (Wholesale Distribution Authorisation for Human medicines) who verify 
our suppliers are appropriately licenced etc. 
 

3. Any applicable record retention policy or system name under which QA and stock acceptance 
data would have been logged as of December 2020. 
The original request related to PPE bought by the Covid cell which was not stored in any NHS 
Supply Chain warehouse and therefore SCCL does not hold this information, you may wish to 
redirect your request to the DHSC FOI team. 
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We hope that this response addresses your request.  However, if you are dissatisfied with this 
response, you may request an independent internal review of our handling of your request by 
submitting a complaint within two months to the postal or e-mail addresses above, quoting the 
reference number above.  If you ask for an internal review, it would be helpful if you could say why you 
are dissatisfied with the response. 
 
As part of any internal review the handling of your information request will be reassessed by a 
member of SCCL staff who was not involved in providing you with this response.  If you remain 
dissatisfied after this internal review, you will have a right of complaint to the Information 
Commissioner as established by section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act. 
 
If you require any further information do not hesitate to contact the FOI team. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
FOI Team 
 
Supply Chain Coordination Limited 
Management Function of NHS Supply Chain 
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