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7 August 2025 
 
Dear  
 
RE: SCCL-FOI-2025/26-064 
 
Thank you for your FOI request received by the FOI office for the following information. Your request 
has been handled as a request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 and SCCL 
are able to provide a response in blue below: 
 

1. Was the contract capped at £96.4m? And if so, please provide evidence to that effect, either a 
document or an email. 
SCCL does not hold this information. 

 
2. You say it was a negotiated procedure resulting in a contract not a framework. 

This contradicts earlier assertions by SCCL that there was no contract and no contract exists 
and that the purchase was made utilising existing frameworks. 
Please provide evidence to support this assertion. 
SCCL have no more recorded information to share with you on this issue however, outside of 
the FOI process we can clarify that during the pandemic we were able to access products 
made available by Optimum Medical because they were an existing framework supplier of 
SCCL. Purchases from a framework are made via a contract as published here: Purchases of 
Single Use Theatre Protective Clothing - Contracts Finder and purchase order. 
We have already provided you with all the relevant information regarding the agreement and 
linked you to the information in the public domain and I hope this additional information is 
helpful. 
 

3. The information contained in the document attached to your link does not provide any 
clarification as to what the £96.4m contract was, who it was with or whether there even was 
one. 
Please provide the contract document you are referring to for which £96.4m was the total 
amount available. 
On the above link it states Awarded contract - This means that the contract has been awarded 
to a supplier, it also states that the £96.4m relates to Respirators and the supplier was 
Optimum Medical Solutions Ltd. SCCL have no more recorded information to share with you 
on this issue. 

 
4. Considering there is no Clearance board approval recorded for an Optimum FFP3 contract, it 

would be helpful if you provided the email chain in which refers to the £96.4m total amount for 
the contract, and also the email chain in which the contract amount reduction was referred to. 
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There is another similar contract that was approved by the board, but surely that that couldn't 
be related, right? 
It maybe that the amount was discussed in volume, i.e. 20m approved reduced to 15.5m due 
to revised requirements. Emails making reference to volumes would suffice. 
Please see attached email CAN Breakdown with CAN Breakdown attachment which refers to 
the contract value which was published. However, the value of the contract has since been 
corrected via response SCCL-FOI-2025/26-049.   
SCCL does not hold a record of a contract between Optimum Medical Solutions and SCCL. 
However, please see attached RE_ Optimum Medical - FFP3_Redacted authorising the 
purchase of 15.5m masks at £4.82 per mask.  
 

We hope that this response addresses your request.  However, if you are dissatisfied with this 
response, you may request an independent internal review of our handling of your request by 
submitting a complaint within two months to the postal or e-mail addresses above, quoting the 
reference number above.  If you ask for an internal review, it would be helpful if you could say why you 
are dissatisfied with the response. 
 
As part of any internal review the handling of your information request will be reassessed by a 
member of SCCL staff who was not involved in providing you with this response.  If you remain 
dissatisfied after this internal review, you will have a right of complaint to the Information 
Commissioner as established by section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act. 
 
If you require any further information do not hesitate to contact the FOI team. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
FOI Team 
 
Supply Chain Coordination Limited 
Management Function of NHS Supply Chain 
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