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Nottingham
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NG2 4LA
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www.supplychain.nhs.uk

29 April 2024

oear I

RE: SCCL-FOI-2023/24-131

Thank you for your FOI request received by the FOI office for the following information, your
request has been handled as a request for information under the Freedom of Information Act
2000 and SCCL are able to provide a response below in blue:

8.

9.

We have been asked by one of our Trusts to support them with an innovation and they
are looking a potential market size and wanted to use known consumables to
understand this more.

Total purchased by the NHS would give us an idea. | have identified the following
products but have a feeling there will be others.

. KCM242 Sterilin Ltd Container 30ml Universal Polypropylene White Screw Cap with

Printed Label (Aseptic) SCCL-£78,097.06 sales in the last 12 Months

KCM241 Sarstedt Limited Container 30ml Universal Polypropylene White Screw Cap
with Printed Label (Aseptic) SCCL-£44,795.82 sales in the last 12 Months (38.94%
Market Share)

KCM240 Medline Scientific Ltd Container 10ml Primary Collection with Boric Acid and
Urine Cup SCCL-£0 sales in the last 12 Months

Red Screw Cap, printed label SCCL- We do not hold this information.

KCP225 International Scientific Supplies Container 10ml Primary SCCL-£0 sales in the
last 12 Months

Collection with Boric Acid and Urine Cup Red Screw Cap, printed label - SCCL - see
tables below.

Urine Bags from Clinisupplies Ltd - SCCL- We do not hold this information.

Urine Tubes
Vacutainer for MCS Borate (100) - SCCL - see tables below.
Vacutainer Z No Additive (100) SCCL - see tables below.

10.Urine Transfer Straw (100) SCCL - see tables below.
11.Urine Cup (250) SCCL - see tables below.
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Sum of Sum of Total sales % Mix
Cap Urine Tube £ 3,281.66 0.99%
Collection Device Urine £ 71,703.25 21.68%
Urine Container 100ml | £ - 0.00%
Urine Container 10ml £ 98,125.05 29.67%
Urine Container 11ml £ 6,478.06 1.96%
Urine Container 125ml | £ 777.00 0.23%
Urine Container 2.5ltr £ 36,088.48 10.91%
Urine Container 30ml £ 106,122.20 32.09%
Urine Container 4lir £ 3,301.33 1.00%
Urine Container 5ltr £ 4,827.00 1.46%
Grand Total £ 330,704.03 100.00%

Sum of
Total cost

Base Description

Secondary Description

Urine Collection Plastic 11ml 16x100mm round bottom

Tube hemogard cap without boric acid Vacutainer 364915 £595.79
Urine Collection Plastic 4ml 16 x 100mm round bottom

Tube hemogard cap without boric acid Vacutainer 368500 £19,618.25
Urine Collection

Beaker Sterile specimen cup Vacutainer 364941 £39,213.56
Urine Collection Plastic 10ml with boric acid round bottom

Tube with Boric Acid | hemogard cap Vacutainer 364955 £21,993.38
Urine Collection GBUK

Tube 6 mL 13x100 mm with Yellow push cap Vacusence+ 111506 £0.00
Urine Collection Integrated 100ml (Sterile) 10 mL 16x100 mm GBUK

Beaker Yellow push cap Sterile Vacusence+ 116506 £1,611.18
Urine Collection Vacuette 10.5ml No Additive 16x100mm Urine

Tube Tube YLW/YLW Push Cap Vacuette 455007 £273.75
Urine Collection Vacuette 6.5ml No Additive 13x100mm Urine

Tube Tube YLW/YLW Screw Cap Vacuette 456007 £1,788.88
Urine Collection 100ml Yellow Screw Cap Sterlie with Integrated

Beaker Transfer Device Vacuette 724321 £888.30
Urine Collection 100ml Yellow Screw Cap Non-sterlie with

Beaker Integrated Transfer Device Vacuette 724322 £0.00
Urine Collection

Tube 6ml CCM 13 x 100mm Yellow/Black Push Cap Vacuette 456284 £235.71
Urine Collection

Transfer Device Specimen straw Vacutainer 364940 £14,318.19
Urine Collection

Transfer Device Specimen 8cm straw Vacuette 450251 £7,069.75
Urine Collection

Transfer Device Specimen 15.5cm long straw Vacuette 450252 £158.67

We hope that this response addresses your request. However, if you are dissatisfied with this
response, you may request an independent internal review of our handling of your request by
submitting a complaint within two months to the postal or e-mail addresses above, quoting the
reference number above. If you ask for an internal review, it would be helpful if you could say
why you are dissatisfied with the response.
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As part of any internal review the handling of your

information request will be reassessed by a member of SCCL staff who was not involved in
providing you with this response. [f you remain dissatisfied after this internal review, you will
have a right of complaint to the Information Commissioner as established by section 50 of the
Freedom of Information Act.

If you require any further information do not hesitate to contact the FOI team.
Yours sincerely

FOI Team

Supply Chain Coordination Limited
Management Function of NHS Supply Chain
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