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16t July 2024

Dear [}

RE: SCCL-FOI-2024/25-040

Thank you for your FOI request received by the FOI office for the following information. Your
request has been handled as a request for information under the Freedom of Information Act
2000 and SCCL are able to provide a response in blue below:

List of past and current PPE suppliers since 01 January 2019, with start date and end
date (if applicable) of when they supplied PPE to Supply Chain Coordination Limited
Please see tabs 1 and 2 of the attached spreadsheet and zip file with Contract Award
Notices. We have used the DHSC PPE Cell definition in regard to PPE Suppliers.

What was the total number of units of hon-reusable face masks sourced, and held in
stock, for each month since 01 January 20197

1.

Please give the overall number, and the number broken down by type of mask (e.g.
IIR, FFP3). Please also state what proportion of overall NHS procurement this is for
each type of mask.

Please see tab 3 of the attached spreadsheet.

For each month and type of mask, please provide the suppliers and destinations of
these masks.

SCCL are unable to provide this information as it is exempt from disclosure under
section 43(2) (Commercial Interests) of the FOI Act 2000. This provides that
information can be withheld where disclosure would, or would be likely to, prejudice
the commercial interests of any person (including the public authority holding it).

It is acknowledged that the statutory exemption provided by section 43 of the FOIA
requires SCCL to consider the public interest for and against disclosure of the
requested information. SCCL has considered the public interest arguments for and
against disclosure of information to which the exemption provided by section 43 of
the FOIA applies.

In conclusion, notwithstanding the strong public interest in public authorities
ensuring accountability and transparency, the following public interest factors apply
in the case of the requested information covered by section 43 of the FOIA:
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1. SCCL, contracting NHS Trusts and third-

party contracting bodies have legitimate commercial interests in ensuring that the
terms by which they are able to operate (including the manner in which they
contract) are optimal. Supplier pricing is derived either under tender conditions or
subsequent price competitions (mini-competitions, e-auctions etc.) and conducted
under controlled, confidential processes.

2. Torelease a copy of this data would:

a. damage commercial relations between the Trust and/or SCCL and its suppliers.
b. adversely impacts SCCL'’s ability to manage its relationship with both the
relevant external suppliers and NHS Trusts.

c. adversely impacts SCCL/NHS Supply Chain’s ability to achieve best value
solutions with its suppliers, who may be constrained in offering those solutions
should they be at risk of disclosure under FOIA.

It is not in the public interest to prejudice any of SCCL/NHS Supply Chain, relevant
NHS Trusts and relevant supplier commercial interests at the expense of disclosure
which is likely to damage commercial relations and adversely impact on our ability
to manage our relationships and any future tenders.

3. Are there forecasted changes to the above in the next 12 months?
This is dependent on customer demand over the next 12 months and therefore
SCCL are unable to answer.

¢ What was the total number of units of reusable respirators sourced, and held in stock,

for each month since 01 January 2019?

1. Please give the overall number, the number broken down by type of respirator (e.g.
elastomeric half mask respirator, powered air purifying respirator). Please also state
what proportion of overall NHS procurement this is for each type of respirator.
SCCL does not hold this information.

2. For each month and type of respirator, please provide the suppliers and
destinations of these respirators.
SCCL does not hold this information.

3. Are there forecasted changes to the above in the next 12 months?
This is dependent on customer demand over the next 12 month and therefore
SCCL are unable to answer.

e What plans or protocols does Supply Chain Coordination Limited have in place in the

event of PPE shortages?
This activity is owned by DHSC, SCCL enact their plans as an agent.

We hope that this response addresses your request. However, if you are dissatisfied with this
response, you may request an independent internal review of our handling of your request by
submitting a complaint within two months to the postal or e-mail addresses above, quoting the
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reference number above. [f you ask for an internal
review, it would be helpful if you could say why you are dissatisfied with the response.

As part of any internal review the handling of your information request will be reassessed by a
member of SCCL staff who was not involved in providing you with this response. If you
remain dissatisfied after this internal review, you will have a right of complaint to the
Information Commissioner as established by section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you require any further information do not hesitate to contact the FOI team.
Yours sincerely

FOI Team

Supply Chain Coordination Limited
Management Function of NHS Supply Chain
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